
I 
Societies Registfation [I975 : T.N. Act 27 

THE TAMIL NADU SOCIETIES REGISTRATION 
ACT, 1975. I 

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS. 

SECTIONS, 

CHAPTER I. 

1. Short title, extent and commencement, 
2. Definitions. 

CHAPTER 11. 

CONST~TUTION AND REG~STR 

3. Societies which may be registered. 1 
4. Compulsory registration of certain societies. 
5. Optional registration. 
6. Memorandum, by-laws, etc., to be filed I ith the Registrar. 
7. Memorandum and by-laws to be printed or typewritten and 

signed. 
8. By-laws. 
9. Name of society. 

10. Certificate of registration. 
11. Change of name of registered society. 
12. Amendment of memorandum and by-laws. 

CHAPTER 111. 

13. Registered office. 
14. Register of members. 
15. Committee. 
16. Accounts and audit. 
17. Supply of copies of by-laws, etc., to members. 
18. Property of registered society, how vested. 
19. Members guilty of offences punishable as strangers. 



1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Registrati~n 467 

SECTIONS. 

20. Legal proceedings by or against registered societies. 
21, Judgment how enforced. 
22. Suit to recover penalty. 
23. Members liable to be sued as strangers. 
24. Investment of funds. 
25. Application of funds of a registered society. 
26. Annual general meetings. 
27. Filing of special resolution. 
28. Extraordinary general meeting. 
29. Minutes of proceedings of' registered society's general meetings 

and of its committee. 
30. Amalgamation and division of registered societies. 
31. Saving of rights of creditors. 
32. Certain mortgages and charges to be void, if not registered. 
33. Registration of satisfaction of mortgage or charge. 
34. Power of Registrar to call for information or explanation. 

I CHAPTER IV. 

35. Inspection of books. 
36. Power of Registrar to inquire into the affairs of registered societ), 
37. Cancellation of registration. 
38. Cancellation of registration of society carrying on unlawful acti- 

vities. 
39. Effect of cancellation of registration. 
40. Winding-up of registered society. 
41. Dissolution of registered societies and adjustment of their affairs, 
42. On dissolution, no member to receive profit. 
43. Liquidator to make up account after winding-up of registered 

society. 
4.4. Removal of defunct registered societies, 
45. Appeals. 

125- 10-30~ 



468 Societies Registration 1 [I975 : T.N. Act 27 

CHAPTER V. 

OFFENCES AND PROCEDURE. 

46. Penalty for non-compliance with Act. 
47 Penalty for falsifying documents. 
48 Pcnalty for furnishing false information o 1 disobeying summons, 

requisition or other lawful order or direction. 
49. Power of Registrar to condone delay in certain cases. 
50. Cognizance of offences. 

I 
CHAPTER VI. I 

FEES AND SUPERVISION. 

51. Fees. i 
52. Powers of Inspector-General of Registration, 

I 
CHAPTER VII. 1 

53. Application of Act to existing registered societies. 
54. Exemption. 
55. Acts of registered societies, etc., not to b invalidated by certain 

defects. 
i 

56. Power to make rules. 
57. Repeals and savings. 

I 
58. Publication of rules, commence~nent of rules and notifications 

and placing them on the Table of the Legislature. 



1975: T. Pi. Act 271 Societies Registratioa 461) 

TAMIL NADU ACT NO. 27 OF 1979,* 

THE TAMIL NADU SOCIETIES REGISTRATION 
ACT, 1975. 

[Received the assent of the President on the 18th August 
1975, jirst published in the Tamil Nadu Government 
Gazette Extraordinary on the 25th August 1975 (Avani 9, 
Iratchasa (2006 - Tiruvalluvar Aandu)).] 

An Act to provide for the registration of literary, 
scientific, religious, charitable and other societies in the 
State of Tamil Nadu. 

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Tamil Nadu 
in the Twenty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as 
follows :- 

CHAPTER I. 

PRELIMINARY. 

1 .  (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Societies Short title, 
Registration Act, 1975. extent and . 

commencement. 

(2) It extends to the whole of the State of Tamil 
Nadu. 

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the Govern- 
ment may, by notification, appoint and different dates 
may be appointed for different areas and for different 
provisions of this Act: 

Provided thAt any reference in any such provision to 
the commencement of this Act shall, in relation to any 
area, be construed as a reference to the coming into 
force of that provision in such area. 

2. In this Act, unless the context c 2herwir;e requires- Ddnitioo8. 
(a) c c  committee' ' means the governing body of 

a registered society to whom the management of its affairs 
is entrusted ; 

.* - --- ---- 
*For Statement ~f Objects and Reasons, see Tornil Ngdrr Go"- 

ernrnent Gazette Extraordin;dry, dated the 14th December 1972, Part 
IV-Section 3, Pages 588-589. 



I 
470 societies &egistration [I975 : T.N. Act f l  

(b) " court " means, in the Presidency town, the 
Madras City Civil Coil.rt and elsewhere, the District 
Court ; 

(c) :)"district " means the district formed under 
section 5 of the Registration Act, 1908 (Central Act XVI 
of 1908) ; 

(d) " financial year" means the period of twelve 
months for which the accounts of 2 registered society are 
req~r.ired to be made up by the by-laws of the registered 
society and if the by-laws do not so provide, the period 
of twelve months ending with the thirty-first day of March 
each year ; 

(e) Government" means the State Government ; 

(j) '& memorandum " m a n s  the memorandum of 
association of a registered society as orjginally framed 
and as amended, from time to time, in pursuance of tbe 
provisions of this Act ; 

(g)  a officer " includes any trustee, director, manager, 
treasurer, secretary, assistant secretary or member of 
the committee, or any person authorised in this behalf 
by the by-laws of the registered society to bring or defend 
or cause to be brought or defended any action or other 
legal proceeding touching c r concerning any property, 
right or claim of the registered society or any other person 
empowered under its by-laws to give directions in regard 
to the business of the registered society ; 

(h) cc registered society" means a society registered 
or deemed to be registered under this Act ; 

(i) " Registrar " means the Inspector-General of 
Registration appointed under sub-section (1) of section 
3 of the Registration Act, 1908 (Central Act XVI of 1908), 
or the Registrar of a district appointed under section 6 
of that Act, or any person autharised by the Government 
to exercise all or any of the powers of the Registrar 
under this Act ; 

(j) "special resolution" means a resolution passed by 
a majority of not less than three-fourths of such members 
of a registered society en~i tkd to vote as are present in 
person or by proxy (where proxies are allowed) at a general 
meeting of which a notice of not less than such period as 
may be prescribed, specifying the intention to propoat 
the resolution as a special resolution, has been duly given: 



I 1.975 : T.N. Act 171 Societies Regi8tratiort 471 

Provided that, if all the members entitled to vote 
at any such meeting so agree, a resolution may be passed 
as a special resolution at a meeting of which a notice of 
less than the period prescribed under this clause has been 
given 1 

(k) "transferred territory" means the Kanyalcumari 
district and the Shencottah taluk of the Tirunelveli district. 

I CHAPTER 11. 

3. (1) Subject to the provisions of sub-section (2), any societies which 
society wbich has for its object the promotion of education, may be 
literature, science, religion, charity, social reform, art, regstered. 
aafts, cottage industries, athletics, sports (including 
indoor games) recreation, public health, social service, 
cultural activities, the diffusion of usefi.1 knowledge or 
such other usehl object with respect to which the State 
Legislature has power to make laws for the State, which 
may be prescribed, may be registered under this Act. 

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub- 
section (I), no association which has for its object the 
improvement of the economic condition of workmen, 
r,o club where games of chance providing prizes for 
yimers are played and no society which does not consist 
of at least seven persons shall be registered under this Act. 

4. (1) Subject to the provisions of sub-sections (3) Compulsory 
and (4), every society formed on or after the date of the registration 
commencement of this Act, which has for its object any zi$iz 
object mentioned in, or prescribed under section 3, 
and 

(a) which consists of not less than twenty 
mtmbes ; or; 

'6) whose annual gross income or expenditure in 
any finalcia1 year after the date of the commencement 
of this Act, is not less than ten thousand rupees, 
shall be legistered under this Act within such priod as 
may be pscribed. 

(2) Ewry society in existence on the date of the 
commencenent of this Act, which has for its object any 
object ment~ned in, or prescribed under section 3 and 



. . .  

4 2  Societies 8egistration 11915 : T.N. A C ~  ij 

which has not been registered 11,nder the Societies Registra- 
tion Act, 1860 (Central Act XXI of 1860), or under any 
law corrcsponding to this Act in force in the transfe~red 
territory immed~ately before the date of the commence- 
ment of t h ~ s  Act inchding the Travancore Cochin 
Literary, Scientific and Char~lable Societies Registration 
Act, 1955 (Travancore-Cochin Act XI1 of 1955) and 

(i) which consists of not less than twenty members ; 
or 

(ii) whose annual gross income or expenditure in 
any fhancial year after the date of the c;ommencement 
of this Act, is not less than ten thouzand rupees ; or 

- 

(iii) whose gross income or expenditure in any 
such period preceding the date of the commencement of 
this Act, was not less than such amount, as may be 
prescribed, the period so prescribed, bearing to twelve 
months the same proporiion as the amav.nt so prescribed 
bears to ten thousand rupees ; 
shall be registered cnder this Act within such period as 
may be prescribed. 

(3) Nothing in this section shall apply to any society 
which has far its object the promotica of religion, athle- 
tics or sports (inc11,ding indoor games). 

(4) Nothing contained in this Act shall be deemed 
to require the rtgistration ~ n d e r  this Act of any sociefy 
formed, established, registered or incorporated under any 
other law. 

Opf ional 5. Any society which has for its object- 
r eglstration. 

(a) the promotion of religioa, athletics or sports 
(includ~ng indoor games) ; or 

(b) any other object mentioned in, or prescribed 
under, secticn 3 and to which society the provirions of 
section 4 are not applicable, 
may, at its option, be registered under this Act. 

Mmora*dum* 6. For the purpose of registration of a socidy, there by-laws, etc., 
to be filed shall be filed with the Registrar of the district in which 
with the 
Regiotrar, 



. - 
f973 : $A. ~ c t  273 Societies ~egistration- 4 jj 

the society is formed by a qember of the committee of 
the society or by any person duly authorized by the com- 
mittee in this behalf- 

(1) a memorandum specifying- 

(a) the name of the society ; 

(b) the objects of the society ; and 

I (c) the names, addresses and occupations of the 
members of the committee ; and 

I (2) the by-laws of the society. 

7. (1) The memorandum and the by-laws of the Memorandum 
society shall be printed or typewritten. and by-laws 

to be printed 
or typewritten 

(2) The memorandum shall be signed by at least and signed. 
seven members who shall add their addresses and occu- 
pation in the presence of at least one witness who shall 
attest the signatures. 

(3) The by-laws shall be signed by the signatories to 
the memorandum. 

8. The by-laws shall contain provisions in respect of BY-laws. 
such matters as may be prescribed. 

9. (1) No society shall be registered by a name which, Name of 
ill the opinion of the Registrar, is undesirable. society. 

Explanation.-For the purposes of this sub-section, the 
namz of a society shall be deemed to be undesirable, if 
such name is- 

I (a) obscene or against decency and decorum ; or 

(b) likely to promote disharmony or feeline of 
enmity, or hatred or ill-will between different religious, 
racial, language, or regional groups or castes or commu- 
nities ; or 

1 (c) identical with, or too nearly resembles, the 
name by which a society in existenoe has been previously 
registered. 



(2) Except with the previous sanction in writing of 
the Government, no society shall be registered by a name 
which contains any of the following words, namely :- 

474 Societies Registration 

I (a) ulCo-operative " or " Land Dewlopment "; 

[1975 : T.N. Act 8 

(b) Reserve Banh " ; 1 

(c )  Union " or " State " or any word expressing 
or implying the sanction, approval or patronage of the 
Central or any State Government ; and 

(d) :'Municipal" or "Chartered" or any 
word which suggests or is calculated to suggest connection 
with any municipality or other local authority : 

Provided that nothing in this sub-section shall apply 
to societ ids registered under the Societies Registration 
~ c t ,  1860 (Central Act XXI of 1860), before the date of 
the commencement of this Act. 

Certificate of 10. (1) The Registrar, on being satisfied that a society 
registration. has complied with the provisions cf this Act, and 

the rales made thereunder as to registration, shall issue 
to that society a ctrtificat,: of registration and such certifi- 
cate shall be conclusive evidence that the society therein 
mentioned is duly registered, unless it is proved that the 
registration of the society has been cancelled. 

Change of 
name of 
registered 
society. 

(2) The Registrar shall, after the issue of a certifi- 
cate of registration to a society, enter in a register prescribed 
in that behalf such partic~llars as may be prescribed. 

11. (1) Any registered society may, by special resaln- 
tion and with the approval in writing of the Registrar, 
change its name : I 

Provided that if a society, through inadvertance 
or: otherwise, is registered by a name identical with that 
by which a society in existence is previously registered 
or so nearly resembling it as to be calculated to deceive, 
the first mentioned society may, with the approval in 
writing of the Registrar, change its name. 



I 1875 : T.N. Act Societies Aegistratbn 475 

(2) Where a registered society changes its name as 
aforesaid, the Registrar shall enter the new name i n  the 
register in the place of the former name, anc! shall issue a 
fresh certiflate of registration with the necessary altera- 
tions embodied therein ; and the change of name shall be 
complete and effe~tive only on the issue of such certificate. 
The Registrar shall also make the necessary amendment 
in the memorandum of the registered society. 

(3) (a) Any change of name shall not affect any 
right or obligation of the registered society or of any 
member thereof or render defective any legal proceeding 
touching or concerning any property, right or claim of 
the registered society. 

(b) Any action or other legal proceeding that 
might have been continu.ed or commenced by or against 
the committee or officer referred to in s11.b-section (1) of 
section 20 may be continued or commenced as if the name 
of the society had not been changed. 

12. (I) A registered society may, by special resolution, Amendment 
amend the provisions of its memorandum relating to the of memorandum 
objects of the registered society so far as may be req~birrd and 
to enable it- 

(a) to carry on the administration of the registered 
society more economically or more efficiently ; or 

(b) to attain its main pv-rpose by new or improved 
means ; or  

(c) to amalgamate with any other registered 
society ; or 

(d)  to divide itself into two or more societies. 

(2) A registered society may, by special resolution, 
amend its by-laws. 

(3) An amendment of the memorandum or the by- 
laws shall be registered and on such registration shall 
take effect from the date of the passing of such special 
resolu.tion. 

(4) If the Registrar is satisfied that any amendment 
of the memorandumor the by-laws is not contrary to tlm 



I 
4'18 gocteties Registration 11975 : T.PJ. Aet 29 

provisioils of this Act, or  the rules made thereunder, he 
may register the amendment. When the Registrar 
registers an amendment of the memorandum or theby-laws, 
he shall issue to the registered society a copy of the amend- 
ment certified by him, which shall be conclusive evidence 
that the amendment has been duly registered. 

CHAPTER 111. 

MANAGEMENT AND ADMINISTRATION. 

Registered 13. Every registered society shall- 
Office. 

(1) have a registered oflice to which all comm~nica- 
tions and notices may be fiddressed and shall file with the 
Registrar notice of sit~,ation of such office and of any 
changz thereof within such period as may be prescribed 
after the date of the registration of the society or after 
the date of change, an the case may be ; 

(2) keep displayed on the outside of its registered 
office its name in a conspicuous position, in legible 
characters and, if the characters employed therefor are 
not those of Tamil, also in the characters of Tamil. 

Register of 14. (1) Every registered society shall maintain a 
members. register containing the names, addresses and occupations 

of its members. 

(2) The register of members shall, during business 
hours, be open to the inspection of any member free of 
charge and any member may make extracts therefrom. 

Committee. 15. (1) Every registered society shall have a committee 
of not less than three members to manage its affairs. 
Every registered society shall file with the Registrar a copy 
of the register maintained by it under sub-section (1) of 
section 14 and, from time to time, file with the Registrar 
notice of any change among the members of the committee. 

(2) A copy of the register shall be filed either at the 
time of the registration of the society or within such period 
as may be prescribed from the appointment of the members 
of the first committee and the notice of any change among 
the members of the society or of the committee shall be 
filed within such period as may be prescribed from the date 
sf such change. 



I 1975 : T.N. Act $7 Societies Registration 477 

(3) The members of the committee shall be appointed 
at a meeting of the society by a resolution of a majority 
of the members present and entitled to vote thereat. 

(4) The term of office of the members of the committee 
shall not exceed three years from the date of their appoint- 
ment, 

(5) The members of the committee shall be eligible 
for re-appointment. 

16. (1) Every registered society shall keep proper Acco~nts 
books of account and at the expiration of each financial acrL audit. 
year, prepare a receipts and expenditure account and a 
balance-sheet and shall cause them to be audited by an 
auditor or by two or more members of the registered society 
(not being members of the committee), appointed by the 
registered society and possessing the prescribed qualifi- 
cations. 

(2) The auditor or the members appointed under 
sub-section (1) shall have access to all the books and accounts 
of the registered society, and shall examine the receipts 
and expenditure account and the balance sheet and verify 
them with the accounts and vouchers relating thereto, 
and shall either sign them as found by him or them to be 
correct, duly vouched, and in accordance with law, or 
specially report to the registered society in what respects 
he finds or they find them to be incorrect, unvouched, or 
not in accordance with law. 

(3) Every registered society shall- 

(a) within such period as may be prescribed after 
the expiration of each financial year, place before the 
general meeting the receipts and expenditure account and 
the balance sheet together with the report referred to in 
sub-section (2) duly signed by the auditor or the members 
appointed under sub-section (1) and the members of the 
committee ; and 

(b) within such period as may be prescribed after 
the date of such general meeting, file with the Registrar- 

(i) an authenticated copy of such receipts and 
expenditure account, balance sheet and report, 

(ii) a statement of the names, addresses and 
occupations of the persons who, at the expiry of the financial 
year, were members of the registered society, and 



I 

478 Societies RegIjtration '[I975 : T.N. Act 27 

(iii) a declaration to the effect that the society 
has been carrying on business or has been in operation 
during the financial year, 

1 

Supply of 
copies of 
by-laws, etc., 
to members. 

Property of 
r6gistend 
society, how 
vested. 

Members guilty 
of offinces 
punishable as 
strangers. 

d l 

17. Every registered society s all supply t o  any 
member, on application and on payment of such fee as 
may be prescribed, a copy of- 

(i) its by-laws ; 1 
(ii) the receipts and expenditure account ; and 

(iii) the balance sheet. 
I 

IS. All property, movable and immovable, belonging 
to a registered society, whether acquired before or after 
its registration, if not vested in trustees, shall vest in the 
committee ; and any such property may in any legal 
proceeding, be referred to as the property of the committee. 

19. Any member of a registered society who steals, 
purloinr or embezzles any money or other property, or 
wilfully and maliciously destroys or injures any property 
of the registered society, or forges any deed, bond, security 
for money, receipt or other instrument whereby the funds 
of the registered society may be exposed to loss, shall be 
subject to the same prosecution, and, if convicted, shall be 
liable to be punished in like manner as any person who 
is not a member would be subject and liable to in respect 
of the like offence. 

Legal 2). (1) The committee or any officer of the registered 
proceedings society authorised in this behalf by its by-laws may bring 
by or against or defend or cause to be brought or defended any action 
registered 
Societies. or other legal proceeding touching or concerning any 

property, right or claim of the registered society and may 
sue or be sued in respect of any such property, right or 
claim. 

(2) Any action or other legal proceeding shall not 
abate or be discontinued by the death, resignation or 
removal from office of any officer of the registered society. 

' 21. (1) If a judgment is passed against any officer 
Judmnt how referred to in sub-section (1) of section 20, such judgment enforced shall not be enforced against the property, movable or 

immovable, or against the body, of such officer, but against 
the property of the registered society. 



I 1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Registration 479 

(2) The application for execution shall set forth the 
judgment, the fact of the party against whom it shall have 
been passed having sued or having been sued, as the case 
may be, on behalf of the registered society only, and shall 
require to have the judgment enforced against the property 
of the registered society. 

. Where any by-law of a registered society provides Suit to recover 
for the imposition of any pecuniary penalty for any breach penalty. 
thereof, such penalty, when accrued, may be recovered 
by suit filed in the court having jurisdiction where the 
defendant resides or the registered office of the registered 
society is situate. 

23. (1) Any member of a registered society who is in Membersliable 
arrear of any subscription which according to the by-laws ~~~~~~~ 
of the registered society he is bound to pay, or who is in 
possession of, or detains, any property of the registered 
society in a manner or for a time contrary to such by-laws 
or injures or destroys any property of the registered 
society, may be sued for such arrear or for the damage 
accruing from such possession, detention, injury or destruc- 
tion of property in the manner provided in this Act. 

(2) Where the defendant succeeds in any such suit 
or other proceeding brought against him at the instance of 
the registered society and is adjudged to recover his costs, 
the provisions of section 21 shall apply to such judgment. 

24. A registered society may, to such extent and under r,,,,mmt 
such conditions as may be permitted by its by-laws, from offundo. 
time to time, invest or deposit any portion of its funds 
not immediately required,- 

1 (1) upon immovable properties ; or 

(2) in securities of the Government or in National 
Savings Certificates or other securities of the Government 
of India ; 

(3) in the Post-Office Savings Bank Account ; or 

(4) in a special account opened by the registered 
society for the purpose in a- 

(a) corresponding new bank as defined in the 
Banking Companies (Acquisition and Transfer of Under- 
takings) Act, 1970 (Central Act 5 of 1970) ; or 



i 
4 80 Societies Registration [I975 : T.N. Act 27 

(b) society registered or deemed to be registered 
under the Tamil Nadu Co-operative Societies Act, 1961 
(Tamil Nadu Act 53 of 1961), the primary object or 
principal business of which is the transaction of banking 
business ; or 

(5) in such other mode of investment as may be 
prescribed. 

Application of 25. (1) A registered society shall have power to spend 
fuqds of a out of its funds such sums as it thinks fit on purposes 
regstered authorised by this Act or its by-laws. 
society. 

(2) No part of the funds of a registered society (save 
those funds earmarked specifically for the purpose of making 
provision for a dependant of a deceased or disabled member) 
shall be divided by way of bonus or dividend or otherwise 
among its members : I 

I 

Provided that payment ma) be made from such 
earmarked funds to a dependant of a deceased or disabled 
member of a registered society, subject to such limits, if 
any, prescribed by the by-laws. , 

Explanation.-For the purposd of this sub-section- 

(i) the expression " dependant " means any of the 
following relatives of a deceased or disabled member, 
namely, a wife, husband, parent, child, minor brother, 
unmarried sister and a deceased son's widow and child, 
and where no parent of the deceased or disabled member 
is alive, a paternal grand-parent ; 

(ii) the expression " disabl k d member " means a 
member who, on account of injury, disease, or congenital 
deformity is substantially handicapped in obtaining, or 
keeping employment, or in undertaking work on his own 
account, of a kind wh~ch apart from that injury, disease 
or deformity would be suited to his age, experience and 
qualifications and the expression " disease " in this 
clause shall be construed as including a physical or mental 
condition arising from imperfect development of any 
organ. 

I 
(3) Save as provided in sub-kction (2), no payment 

shall be made out of the funds of a registered society to 
the president or any other officer of the society by way of 
honorarium for any service rendered by him to the society. 



1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Registmtien 48) 

I 26. (1) At least one general meeting of the registered Annual gsaeial 
society shall be held in every financial year. meet. nps. 

(2) Notice of every such general meeting shall be 
given by the registered society to its members within suc11 
period as inay be prescribed before the day appointed for 
the meeting. 

(3) The notice shall specify the day, hour and pIace 
and the object of the me;?ing and, in case any amendment 
of a by-law or objects of association as contained in the 
memorandum is intended to be proposed, shall contain a 
copy of every such amendment. 

(4) The Registrat may nominate an officer subordinate 
to him to be present at any such general meeting. 

27. A copy of every special resolution for any of Filing of 
the purposes mentioned in this Act, signed by an officer of  tion. on. 
the registered society, authorised in this behalf by its 
by-laws shall, within such period as may be prescribed 
froin the passing of the resolution, be filed with the 
Registrar. 

%. (1) The committee may, at any time call ~n Extraordinrtry 
extraordinary general meeting of the registered society and general meeting. 
shall call such a meeting within such period as may be 
prescribed after receipt of a requisition in writing from 
such number of members of proportion of the total number 
of members as may be specified in the by-laws of the 
registered society. 

(2) Jf an extraordinary general meeting is not called 
in accordance with such requisition, the requisitionists 
shall have power to call such meeting themselves. 

(3) No extraordinary general meeting shall be 
I cfeemed to have beell duly called if the members of the 

registered society have not been given such notice thereof 
as is required by sub-sections (2) and (3) of section 26. 

29. (1) Every registered society shall cause minutes Minutes of 
of all proceedings of its general me~tings; and of its corn- pm*dings of 
mittee to br: entered in books kept for the purpose. zz$dgenerd 

meeting and of (2) Any such minute, if purporting to be signed its ,omittm, 
by the chairman of the meeting at which the proceedings 
were held or by the chairman of the next succeeding 
meeting, shall be evidence 01 the proceedings. 

125-10-31 



(3) The books containing the minutes aforesaid and 
the books of account of the registered society shall be 
kept at the registered oEce of the society and shall, during 
business hours be open to the inspection of any member 
free of charge. 

$82 Societies Registratl"on 

4ma1gamati0n 30. (1) Any two or more registe ed societies may with and division i 
of registered the prior approval of the Registrar, by special resolution 
societies. of both or all such registered societies, become amalga- 

mated together as one society, with or without any dis- 
solution or division of the funds of those regtstered 
societies or any of them. 

(2) Any registered society may with the prior appro- 
val of the Registrar, by special resolution, divide itself into 
two or more societies. The resolution shall contain 
proposals for the division of the assets and liabilities of the 
registered soclety among the new societies into which it is 
proposed to divide it and may specify the area of operation 
of, and the members whom will constitute, each of the new 
societies. 

(3) No amalgamation or division of a registered 
society under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2), as the case 
may be, shall have any effect until and unless the new 
society or societies is or are duly registered in accordance 
with the provisions of this Act. 

(4) Upon the registration of the new society or 
societies, as the case may be, the assets and liabilities of 
the original registered society or societies shall, subject 
to the provisions of section 18, be transferred to, and be 
the assets and liabilities of the new society or societies, 
in the manner specified in the special resolution mentioned 
in sub-section (1) or sub-section (2), as the case may 
be. 

[19;79 : ~ . h .  Act 2'4 

Saving of 31. An amalgamation or division in pursuance of 
rights of section 30 shall not prejudice any right of a creditor of 
creditors. any registered society which was a party to such amalga- 

mati011 or of the registered society which was the subject 
of such division. 

Cartain 32. (1) Every mortgage or charge created on or after 
mortgages the date of the commencement of this Act by a registered and charges 
to be ",,id if society and being either- 
not registered, (a) a mortgage or charge for the purpose of 

securing any issue of debeatures ; or 



1h5 : T.N. Act 274 Societies Registration 483 

(b) a mortgage or charge on any immovable 
property wherever situate, or any interest therein, 

shall, so far as any security on the registered society's 
property or undertaking is hereby conferred, be void 
against the liquidator and any creditor of the registered 
society, unless the prescribed particulars of the mortgage 
or charge, together with the instrument, if any, by which 
the mortgage or charge is created or evidenced or a copy 
thereof verified in the prescribed manner, are filed with 
the Registrar for registration within such period as may 
be prescribed after the date of its creation by any person 
authorised in this behalf by such registered society and 
when a mortgage or charge becomes void under this sub- 
section, the money secured thereby shall immediately 
become payable : 

Provided that- 

(i) in the case of a mortgage or charge created 
out of India and comprising solely property situate outside 
India the period prescribed under this sub-section shall be 
reckoned from the date on which the instrument or co v 
could, in due course of post and if despatched with t k  
due diligence, have been received in India, and 

(ii) where the mortgage or charge is created in 
India but comprises property situate outside India, 
the instruments creating or purporting to create 
the mortgage or charge or a copy thereof verified in the 
prescribed manner may be filed for registration, notwith- 
standing that further proceedings may be necessary to make 
the mortgage or charge valid or effectual according to the 
law of the country in which the property is situate. 

(2) Where a registered society acquires any 
property which is subject to a mortgage or charge of 
any such kind as would, if it had, been created by the 
registered society after the acquisition of the property, 
have been required to be registered under sub-section (I), 
the registered society shall cause the prescribed . 
particulars of the mortgage .or charge, together with the 
copy (certified in the prescribed manner to be a correct 
copy) of the instrument, lf any, by which the mortgage or 
charge was created or is evidenced, to be filed with the 
Registrar for registration within such period as may be 
prescribed after the date on which the acquisition is 
completed : 

125-1043 1~ 



Sockties Registration [I975 : T.N. Act 

Provided that if the property is situate and the 
mortgage or charge was created outside India, the period 
prescribed under this sub-section shall be reckoned from 
the date on which the copy of the instrument could, i~ 
due course of post and if despatched with due diligence, 
have been received in India. 

Registration of 33. It shall be the duty of every registered society to 
satisfaction of file with the Registrar notice af the final payment or 

Or full satisfaction of any mortgage or charge requiring charge. registration under section 32 within such period as may be 
prescribed from the dare of the paymer't or satisfaction. 

Powzr of  34. (1) Where the Registrar, on perusal of any 
Registrar to document which a registered society is required to file 
call for with him under the provisions of this Act, is of opinion 
infornlajion or that any information or explanation is necessary with 
explanatlon* respect to any matter to which such document purports 

to relate, he may, by order in writing, call on the registered , 
society filing the document to furnish in writing sucll 
information or explanation within such time as he may 
specify in the order. 

(2) On receipt by the registered society of an order 
under sub-section (I), it shall be the duty of all persons 
who are or have been its officers to furnish such infor- 
mation or explanation to the best of their power. 

(3) On receipt of such information or explanation, the 
Registrar may annex the same to the original document 
filed with him, and any additional document so annexed 
by the Registrar shall be subject to the like provisions as to 
inspection and the taking of copies, as the origin*] 
document is subject. 

CHAPTER N. 
INSPECTION, INQUIRY, CANCELLATION, WI~DING-up AND 

APPEAL. 
InsPectioil 35, The books of every registered society shall, at 

reasonable hours be open to inspection by the Registrar, 
or by any person authorised by him in this behalf. 

Power of 36. (1) The Registrar may, of his own motion or on the 
Registrar to application of a lnajorlty of the members of the committee 
inquire into of a registered society or on the application of not less than 1 

thoaffairs of one-third of the.mqmbers of that registered society,or, if so 
registered 
,,iety moved by the Dlstrlct Collector, hold, or direct some person 

nuthorised by the Registrar by order in writing in this 
behalf to hold, an inquiry, into the constitution, working 
and financial condition of that registered society, 



~ 

1975 n T.N. Act 271 Societies Registration 485 

(2) An application to the Registrar under sub-section 
(1) shall be supported by such evidence as the Registrar 
may require for the purpose of showing that the applicants 
have good reason for applying for an inquiry. 

(3) The Registrar may require the applicants under 
sub-section (1) to furnish such security as he thinks fit 
for the costs of the proposed inquiry, before the inquiry 
is held. 

(4) All expenses of, and incidental or prelinlinary toj 
the inquiry shall, where such inquiry is held- 

(a) on application, be defrayed by the applicants 
therefor or out of the assets of the registered society or by 
the members or officers of the registered society, in such 
proportions as the Registrar may, by order in writing, 
direct ; and 

(b) on the District Collector's or Registrar's 
motion, be defrayed out of the assets of the registered 
society, and shall be recoverable as an arrear of land 
revenue. 

(c) An order made under sub-section (4) shall, on 
applicatio!n, be enforced by any civil court having loca 
jurisdiction in the same manner as a decree of such court. 

(6) ,4 person holding an inquiry under this section 
shall at all reasonable times have free access to all the books, 
accounts and documents of the registered society, and shall 
have powex to call upon the registered soclety and the 
officers of the registered society to produce such books, 
accounts ;and documents and furnish such statements and 
other information in relation to its business as he may 
direct. 

(7) It shall be the duty of all persons who are or have 
been officers of the registered society to  furnish the inquir- 
ing officer with all the books, accounts and documents in 
their custody or power relating to the registered society. 

(8) A person holding an inquiry under this section 
may summon any person who? he has reason to believe, has 
knowledge of any of the affalrs of the registered socioty 
and may examine such person on oath and may summon 
any person to produce any books, accounts or documents 
belonging to him or in his custody if the person holding 
the inquiry has reason to  believe that such books, accounts. 
or 'documents contain any entries relating to transactions 
of the registered society. 



486 Ssiet ies  Registration [I975 a T.N. Act 27 

19) The result of the inquir shall ba communiaated 
to tha registered society and to the; applicants, if any. 

 ation ion 37. When an inquiry has been held under section 36, 
Of registration' the Registrar may, lf he is satisfied- 

(a) that the registered society has contravened any 
of the previsions of this Act or the rules made there- 
under; or 

(b)  that the registered society is insolvent, or must 
necessarily become so ; or 

(c) that the business of any such registered society is 
conducted fraudulently or not in accordance with the by- 
laws or the objects specified in the memorandum filed with 
the Registrar under section 6, , 
after giving in such manner, as he tknks fit, previous notice 
in writing to the registered society, specifying briefly the 
grounds of the proposed cancellation and after giving 
an opportunity to the registered society to show cause 
why the cancellation should not be made, cancel the 
registration of the registered society, and communicate 
the order of cancellation forthwith to the registered society 
by registered post. 

i 
I 

Cancdlation of 38. (1) If it: appears to the Reg strar that any registered 
I 

registration of society is carrying on any unlawful activity or allows I 
society 
carrying on unlawful activity to be carried on within any premises 
unlawful under the control of the society, the Registrar may hold 
activities. an enquiry into the activities of such society, and in 

respect of every such enquiry, the Registrar shall have the 
1 

same powers as are specified in sub-sections (6), (7) and (8) 
of section 36. 

(2) If on an enquiry under sub-section (I), the 
Registrar is satisfied that any such society has been carrying 
on any unlawful activity or has allowed any unlawful 
activity to be carried on within any premises under the 
control of the society, lle shall, after giving reasonable 
notice to the society to show cause why the registration of 
the society should not be cancelled and after considering 
the repreeentations, if any, made on behalf of the society, 
by order cancel the registration of the society. The 
Registrar shall communicate the order of cancellation 
forthwith to the registered society. 

Explanation.--For purposes of this section, an activity 
shall be deemed to be unlawful if such activity is an offence 
punishable under any provision of law for the time being 
in force. 



1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Registration 487 

39. When the registration of a registered society is Effect of 
cancelled, the registered society shall forthwith cease to ::;?!:?$ 
carry on its business, except so far as may be required 
for the beneficial winding-up thereof, for which purpose 
it shall pass a special resolution and dissolve itself in the 
manner provided in section 41. 

40. (1) Where the registration of a registered society winding-up af 
is cancelled, the Registrar may appoint a liquidator to registered 
wind-up the society if the society has not, within such s0ciefy* 
period as may be prescribed from the date of the order of 
cancellation, taken any action under section 39. 

(2) A liquidator shall have power subject to the 
control of the Registrar- 

(a) to institute or defend any action or other legal 
proceeding on behalf of the registered society by his name 
of office ; 

(b) to determine, from time to time, the contri- 
bution to be made or remaining to be made by the members 
of the registered soclety, respectively, to the assets of the 
registered society ; 

(c) to investigate all claims against the registered 
society and, subject to the provisions of this Act, to decide 
questions of priority arising between claimants ; 

( d )  to determine by what persons and in what 
proportions the costs of the liquidation are to be borne ; 
and 

(e)  to give such directions in regard to the collection 
and distribution of the assets of the registered society as 
may appear to him to. be necessary for winding-up the affairs 
of the registered soc~ety. 

(3) Subject to any rules of procedure made under I 

this Act a liquidator shall, in so far as such powers are 
necessary to carly out the purposes of this section, have 
power to summon and enforce the attendance of witnesses 
and to compel the production of documents, as far as 
may be, by the same means and in the same manner as is 
provided in the case of a civil court by the Code of Civil 
Procedure, 1908 (Central Act V of 1908). 

(4) An order made under this section shall, on app& 
cation, be enforced by any civil court having local juri&c- 

I tion in the same manner as a decree of such court, 



48 8 
1 

Societies Registration [1975: T.N. Act 27 

Dissolution of 41. (1) A registered society may, by special resolution, 
determine that it shall be dissolved and thereupon it shall bc 

societies and dissolved f',irthwitl~ or at the time specified in the resolution 
adjustmeflt of and all necessary steps shall be taken for the disposal and 
thwr affairs. se~iiemen~ of the property of the registered society and its 

claims and liabil~ties wording to the by-laws, if any, 
of the registered society and if there are no by-laws, 
according as the committee, or where a special committee 
is appointed under sub-section (2), the special committee, 
may find it expedient. 

(2) A registered society may, when passing the 
special resolution rcferred to in sub-section (I), appoint 
a special committee consisting of such number of members 
as may be specified in the resolution for winding-up the 
affairs of the registered society. 

(3) If any dispute arises among the members of the 
registered society, the committee, or the special committee, 
if any, the adjustment of the affairs of the registered society 
shall be referred to the court and the court shall make such 
order in the matter as it shall deem fit ; 

Provided that any matter decided by a special 
resolution of the registered society by the committee or by 
the special committee, if any, shall not be deemed to be a 
matter in dispute within the meaning of this sub-section. 

(4) If the Central or any State Government is a 
meaber vf, or a contributory to, or otherwise interested 
in, any registered society, such society shall not be dissolved 
under sub-section (1) without the consent of the Central 
or State Government concerned. 

On dissolu[ion, 42. If, upon the dissolution of any registered society, 
no member to there shall remain after the satisfaction of all its debts 
receive profit. lllci liabilities, any property whatsoever, the same shall 

not be paid to or distributed among the members of the 
said society, or any of them, but shall be given to some 
other registered society or to any association of persons 
having tllc same objtcts or objects similar to those of such 
registered society, to be determined by a special resolution 
or in default thereof by the court : 

Provided that this section shall not apply to any 
society which shall have been founded or establisl~ed by 
the contributions of shareholdel-s, in the nature of a joint 
stock company. 

~ i q u i d a t o r  10 43. (1) As soon as the affairs of a registered society are 
make account completely wound-up, the liquidator shall make up an 
: ~ ~ f ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ G d  account of the winding-up showing how the w'nding-up 
SOCI~~Y. has been conducted and the property of the registered 



1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Wegistratlon 4 89 

ssciety has been digposed of, and call ti general meeting 
of the registered society f o ~  the purpose of placing befcre 
it the account and giving any explanation in respect thereof. 

(2) Within such period as may be prescribed after the 
meeting, the liquidator shall send to the Registrar a copy 
of the account and shall make a return to him of the 
holding cf the meeting and of its date. 

(3) If a quorum is not present at the meeting aforesaid, 
the liquidator shall, in lieu of the return referred to in 
sub-section (2), make a return that the meeting was duly 
called and that no quorum was present thereat. 

44. (1) Where the Registrar has reasonable cause to Removal of 
believe that a registered society is not carrying on business defunct 
or in operation, he shall send to the registered society by 
registered post a letter enquiring whether the society is 
carrying on business or in operation. 

(2) If the Registrar either receives an answer from 
the registered society to the effect that it is not carrying on 
business or in operation, or does not within such period 
as may be prescribed after sending the letter receive any 
answer, he may publish i n  the Tamil Nadzc Government 
Gazette, and send to the registered society by registered 
post, a notice that, at the cxpiratlon of such period as may 
be prescribed from the date of such publication, the name 
of the registered society mentioned therein will, unless 
cause is shown to the contrary, be struck off the register 
and the registered society will be dissolved. 

(3) If, in any case where a registered society- 
(a) is being wound up, the Registrar has reasona- 

b]e cause to believe either,that no liquidator is acting or 
that the affairs of the registered society have been corn. 
pletely wound up ; or 

(b) has not, for three consecutive financial years, 
filed with the Registrar all or any of the documents referred 
to in clause (b) of sub-section (3) of section 16, 
the Registrar may publish in the Tamil Nadu Government 
Gazette, and send to the registered society by registered 
post, a like notice as is provlded in sub-section (2) of this 
section. 

(4) At the expiration of the time mentioned in the 
notice referred to in sub-section (2), or sub-section (3), the 
Registrar may, unless cause fo  the contrary 1s previous& 
shown - .  by the registered soclety, strike its name off the 



register and shall publish notice thereof in the Tamil Nu& 
Governntent Gazette, and, on the publication of such notice, 
the registered society shall be deemed to be dissolved : 

490 Societies Registration 

Provided that the liability, if any, of every officer and 
member of the registered society shall continue and may 
be enforced as if the registered society had not been 
dissolved. 

(5) (a) If a registered society or any member or 
creditor thereof feels aggrieved by the name of the registered 
society having been struck off the register, such registered 
society, member or creditor may, within such period as 
may be prescribed from the date of the publication in the 
Tamil Nadu Government Gazette of the notice of striking 
off the name of the registered society, appeal- 

(i) where the name of the registered society is 
struck off by the Inspector - General of Registration, to the 
Government ; 

(ii) in any other case, to the Inspector-General 
of Registration. 

(b) The Government or th d Inspector-General of 
Registration on being satisfied that the registered society 
was, at the time its name was struck off, carrying on 
business or in operation or otherwise that it is just and 
equitable that the name of the registered society be restored 
to the register, may order such restoration. 

(6) If a registered society or any member or creditor 
thereof feels aggrieved by the order of the Government or 
the ~nspector-General of Registration under sub-section (5), 
the court may, on the application of such registered society, 
member or creditor, made within such period as may be 
prescribed from the date of the receipt by such registered 
society, member or creditor, of such order, and on being 
satisfied that it is just and equitable that the name of the 
registered society be restored to the register, order such 
restoration. 

(7) The registered society whose name is restored to 
the register under sub-section (5) or sub-section (6) shall be 
deemed to have continued in existence as if its name had 
not been struck off ; and the Government or the Inspector- 
General of Registration or the court, as the case may be, 
may, by order, give such directions and make such provi- 
sions as seem just for placing the registered society and all 
other persons in the same position, as nearly as may be, as 
if the name of the registered society had not been struck off. 

I 

$1975 : T.N. Act 27 



1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Registration 491 

45. (1) Any person aggrieved by an order- Appeals. 

(a) refusing to register a society or any amendment 
of the memorandum or by-laws of a society ; or 

(6) cancelling the registration of a registered 
society; or 

(c) made under sub-section (4) of section 36- 

may appeal, if such order is that of- 
(i) the Inspector-General of Registration, to the 

Government ; or 
(ii) any other person, to the Inspector-General 

of Registration. 

(2) Any person aggrieved by any order made by a 
liquidator may appeal to the court. 

(3) Save as expressly provided in this Act, orders 
made under this Act shall be final and conclusive. 

Explanation.-For the purposes of sub-sections (1) and 
(2), " person aggrieved " includes a registered society. 

CHAPTER V. 

46. (1) Where a society, which is compulsorily regi:tera- penalty for 
ble under sub-section (I) or sub-section (2) of section 4, nqn-compliance 
fails to get itself registered within the period sp~cified for with Act. 
registration, every person who is a member of such society, 
shall be punishable with fine which may extend to fifty 
rupees and in the case of a continuing f a1 '1 urc with fine 
which may extend to five rupees for every day during which 
the failure continues. 

(2) Any registered society which makes default in 
complying with any of the requirements of this Act or 
contravenes any of the provisions thereof and every officer 
of the registered society, who is knowingly a party to the 
default or contravention, shall be punishable with fine 
which may extend to one hundred rupees, and in the case 
of a continuing default or contravention with fine which 
may extend to fifty rupees for every day during which 
the default or contravention continues. 



I 
492 Societies Registration [I975 : T.N. Act 27 

?malty for 47. Any person who wilfully makes or causes to be 
falsif~ing made any false entry in, or any omission from, any 
do~uments register, account, balance sheet, or other document, 

required by ihis Act to be maintained by a registered 
society, shall be punishable with fine which may extend 
to five hundred rupees. 

Pena!ty for 48. The coinmittee of a registered society which, or 
furnishing false an officer, employee, or a paid servant or any member :%:$::" Or of the society who, w:lfully makes a false return or furnishes 
sUmmO?s, false informatioil, or any person who wilfully or without 
tequisltlon or any reasonable excuse, disobeys any summons, requi- 
other lawful sition or other lawful order, or direction issued under 
order or 
direction. the provisions of this Acr or who wilfully withholdsor 

fails to furnish any information lawfully required from 
him by a person authorised in this behalf under the pro- 
vision3 of this Act, shall be punishable with fine which 
may extend to five hundred rupees. 

Power of 49. The Registrar may, in his discretion and upon an 
Registrar t o  application in writing by any society, or, as the case may 
condon? delay be, by any regi~tered society, made within the period 
In certaln 
cases. under sub-section (1) or sub-section (2) of 

section 4, clause (I) of section 13, sub-section 
(2) of section 15, sub-section (3) of section 16 or 
section 27, allow to such society further time not exceeding 
such period as may be-prescribed to comply with any of 
the provisions aforesaid. 

Cognizance of 50. NO court inferior to that of a metropolitan magist- 
Wences. rate or a judicial magistrate of the first class shall try any 

offence under this Act. 

CHAPTER VI. 
FEES AND SUPERVISION. 

Fees, 51. (1) There shall be paid to the Registrar in respect 
of the several matters mentioned in the Schedule, the fees 
therein specified. 

(2) The Government may, in their discretion, remit, 
in whole or in part, any fee payable under this Act. 

(3) The Governn~ent may, by notification, authorize 
the Inspector-General of Registration or any officer 
subordinate to him to exercise the power vested in them 
by sub-section (2) and may in like manner withdraw such 
autholity. 

I 



19?5 : T.N. Act 3oeieties Regt'stration 49'3 

(4) The exercise of the power delegated under sub- 
reclion (3) shall be subject to such restrictions and condi- 
tions as may be specified in the notification and also to 
control and revision by the Government or by such officer 
as may be empowered by the Government in this behalf. 
The Government shall also have power to control and 
revise the acts or proceedings of any officer so empowered. 

(5) All fees paid to the Registrar in pursuance of 
this Act slzall be accounted for to the Government. 

51. (1) The Inspector-General of Registration shall Powers of 
have superintendence over all other Registrars functioning Inspector- 
under this Act. General of 

Registration. 

(2) No prosecution shall be instituted under this 
Act without the previous sanction in writing of the Ins- 
pector-General of Registration. 

CHAPTER VII. 

53. Every society registered under the Societies Regist- Application of 
ration Act, 1860 (Central Act XXI of 1860), or under Act to existing 
any law corresponding to this Act in force In the trans- r%islf.red 
ferred territory immediately before the date of the corn- societ'es. 
mencement of this Act including the Travancore-Cochin 
Literary, Scientific and Charitable Societies Registration 
Act, 1955 (Travancore-Cochin Act XI1 of 1955), shall 
be deemed to be registered under this Act, and the by- 
laws of such society, shall, in so far as they are not incon- 
sistent with any provision of this Act, continue in fose  
until altered 01 rescinded. 

54. The Government may, by general or special order Exemption. 
whether prospectively or retrospectively,- 

(1) exempt from all or any of the provisions of this 
Act or from any rule made under this Act, or 

(2) direct that any such provision7or any such rule 
shall apply with such modificationc~as may be specified 
in the order, to any society or&regis~ered~society or class 
of socf etles or of registered societ~es. 



494 Societies Registrat ion 11975 ? T.N. A d  27 

Acts of 55. No act or proceeding of a registered society or 
registered any committee or of any officer of the society shall be 
societies, etc.9 deemed to be invalid merely on the ground- 
not to be 
invalidated by 
certain defects. (a) of any vacancy or defect in the organisation 

of the society or the formation of the general body or 
the constitution of the committee ; 

(b) of any defect or irregularity in the election or 
appointment of a member of the committee or an officer 
of the society 4 or 1 

(c) of any defect or irregularity in such act or pro- 
ceeding aot affecting the merits of the case. 

Power to 56. (1) The Government may make rules to carry out 
make rules. the purposes of this Act. 

(2) In particular and without prejudice to the 
generality of the foregoing power, such rules may provide 
for- 

(a) the objects which may b recognised for the 
purpose of section 3 ; 

a 
(b) the matters in respect of which a society may 

or shall make by-laws and the procedure to be followed 
in making, altering and abrogating by-laws and the condi- 
tions to be satisfied prior to such making, alteration or 
abrogation ; 

(c) the forms to be used for th b purposes of regist- 
ration of societies and for filing documents required or 
authorised to be filed under this Act ; 

(d)  the form of accounts, returns and registers 
required by this Act and the manner in which any such 
accounts, returns or registers shall be verified; 

(e) the naidre of the particulars of the mortgage 
or charge to be filed with the Registrar under section 32; 

(f) the qualifications of auditors and the members 
appointed under sub-section (1) of section 16 and of the 
persons authorised to hold inquiry under section 36 ; 

(g) the procedure to be followed by liquidators 
under this Act J 



f975 : T.N. Act arJ Societies Registratiott 495 

(h) the inspection of documents kept by the 
Registrar and the grant of copies thereof; 

(i) the safe custody of books, papers and docu- 
ments in the Registrar's office and the destruction of 
such of the books, papers and documents aforesaid as 
need no longer be kept ; 

( j )  the time within which appeals under section 45 
shall be preferred ; 

(k) any other matter which has to be or may be 
prescribed. 

57. (1) The Societies Registration Act, 1860 (Central Repeals and 
Act XXI of 1860), in so far as it applies to the State of SaV'ngs. 
Tamil Nadu (hereafter in this section referred to as the 
said Act), is hereby repealed. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, all societies regis- 
tered and all acts done under the said Act- 

(i) by the Registrars of the districts, appointed 
under section 6 of the Registration Act, 1908 (Central 
Act XVI of 1908), at any time during the period commen- 
cing on the 1st September 1954 and ending with the 24th 
March 1955 ; 

(ii) by the Sub-Registrars whose offices were 
amalgamated with the offices of the Registrars under sub- 
section (2) of section 7 of the Registration Act, 1908 
(Central Act XVI of 1908), at any time during the period 
commencing on the 1st September 1954 and ending with 
the 27th May, 1955 ; 

shall be deemed to be, and always to have been, valid 
as if the Registrars of thc districts mentioned in clause (i) 
and the Sub-Registrars mentioned in clause (ii), had power 
to  register such societies and do such acts during the said 
period, and accordingly no registration made and no act 
done by them under the said Act shall be called in question 
merely on the ground that they had no power to register 
such pocieties or to do such acts at the time, the registration 
was made or the act was done : 

Provided that in relation to the territories specified 
in the Second Schedule to the Andhra Pradesh and Madras 
(Alteration of Boundaries) Act, 1959 (Central Act 56 of 



1959), clause (i) of this sub-section'ebll be wastrued as 
if for the expressions " 1st September 1954 " and " 24th 
March 1955 ", the expressions " 1 st October 1954 " and 
" 2211d August 1956 " has respectively been substituted. 

496 Sbcfeties Registration 

(3) Any law corresponding to this Act in force in 
the transferred territory immediately before the date of 
the commencement of this Act including the Travancore- 
Cochin Literary, Scientific and Charitable Societies 
Registratjon Act, 1955 (Travancore-Cochin Act XI1 
of 1955) hereafter in this section referred to as the corres- \ ponding aw) shall stand repealed on the date of such 
commencement. 

[1975 : T.N. Act 5 j )  

(4) The repeal by sub-section (3) of the corresponding 
law shall not affect- 

(a) the previous operation of the corresponding 
law or anything duly done or suffered thereunder; or 

(b) any right, privilege, obligation or liability 
acquired, accrued or incurred under the corresponding 
law ; or 

(c) any fine, penalty, forfeiture or punishment 
incurred in respect of any offence committed against the 
corresponding law ; or 

(d) any investigation, legal proceeding or remedy 
in respect of any such right, privilege, obligation, liability, 
fine, penalty, forfeiture or punishment as aforesaid ; 
and any such investigation, legal proceeding or remedy 
may be instituted, continued or enforced and any such fine, 
penalty, forfeiture or punishment may be imposed as if 
this Act had not been passed. 

(5) Subject to the provisions of sub-section (4) 
anything done or any action taken, including any appoint- 
ment or delegation made, notification, order, instruction 
or direction issued, or, any rule, regulation, form or by- 
law framed, certificate granted or registration effected, 
under the corresponding law shall be deemed to have been 
done or taken under this Act and shall continue to have 
effect accordingly, unless and until superseded by anything 
done or any action taken under this Act. 

(6) For the purpose of facilitating the application of 
this Act in the transferred territory, any court or other 
authority may construe this Act with such alterations not 
affecting the substance as may be necessary or proper to 
adapt it to the matter before the court or other authority. 



1975 : T.N. Act 271 Societies Registration 497 

(7) Any reference to the corresponding law in an) 
law which continues to be in force in the transferred 
territory after the date of the commencement of this Act 
shall, in relation to that territory, be construed as areference 
to this Act. 

58. (1) All rules made under this Act shall be published Publication 01 
in the Tamil Nadu Government Gazette and, unless they rules, commen- 
are expressed to cQme into force on a particular day, $ ~ ~ ~ t ~ . ~ ~ l e s  
shall come into force on the day on which they are so ,ions and 
published. placiag 

them on the 
(2) All notifications issued under this Act shall, table of rhe 

unless they are expressed to come into force on a parti- Legislature. 
cular day, come into force on the day on which they are 
published. 

(3) Every rule made and notification 'issued under 
this Act shall, as soon as possible, after it is made or issued, 
be placed on the table of both Houses of the Legislature, 
and if, before the expiry of the session in which it is so 
placed or the next session, both Houses agree in making 
any modification in any such rule or notification or both 
Houses agree that the rule or notification should not be 
made or issued, the rule or notification shall thereafter 
have effect only in such modified form or be of no effect, 
as the case may be, so however, that any such modification 
or annulment shall be without prejudice to the validity 
of anything previously done under that rule or notifi- 
cation. 

THE SCHEDUL B. 
[See sub-section ( 1 )  of section 51.1 

Table of fees to be paid to the Registrar. 

1. For registration of a society-Fifty Rupees. 

2. For filing any document by-Two Rupees. 
this Act required or authorised 
to  be filed other than the 
memorandum. 

3. For every inspection of docu--Four Ruvees. 
ments (whether one or more) 
in the custody of the Regis- 
trar relating to  one aad 
the same society. 



498 Societies Registratlon f1975 : T.N. Act 27 

4. For issue of certificate of regis--Four Rupees. 
tration or certificate of regis- 
tration on change of name. 

5. For every copy or extract ofdeventy-five paise for 
any document in the custody every hundred words 
of the Registrar. or fractional part 

thereof required to 
be copied. 

6. For a search of documentsA~hree Rupees. 
referred to in items 3 to 5 if 
the year of registration of the , 
society is not given in the 
application, 

I 7. For an appeal under sub--Ten Rupees. 
section (5) or an application 
under sub-section 
section 44 or for an appeal 

tion 45. 
under sub-section (1) of sec- 

I 





frovided that nothing in this clause shall prevent the appoint 
Illem of the same pcrson as special office1 for two O r  more res~stdrcd 
societies. 

(b) The pried specified in such o,rder may, a t  the disc~ktion of 
tho Government, be exten2n4 from time to time provided t h a  such order' 
ahail pot renlain in force for1 morc than three yeai-6 in the aggregate. ' 

(2) The special officer appointed under sub-section (1) shall, 
to the control of the Registrar and to such directions as he may, from 

time to time, give, have power to exercise all or any of the functionq of the 
committee and to take such action as may be required in the intere* of the 
societies. 

(3) The Registrar may fix the remuneration payablc tm the mecia1 
offim appointed under sub-section (1) . The amount of remuneration so 
fixed and such other expenditure incidental t o  the management of the society 
during the period of supersession as may be approvcd by the ~ c g i s t r a r  shall 
be paya5le from the funds of the registered society. 

(4) The special officer appointed under sub-section (1) shall 
arrange for the constitution of a new committee in accordance with the ~ r o v i -  
siosa of thia Act and the rules made thereundy~l and the bye-lawsi of the 
registered society so th i t  the new d o d t t e e  may' be constituted and the 
members thereof come into office a t  the expiry of the p e ~ b d  of appointment 
of the spccial officcr . ' 

(5) Nothing contained in this section shall be deemed to affect the 
powert of the Registrar to order the winding up of the society unde,r section 40. 

(6) An order1 under sub-section (1) shall take cffect from the date 
specified therein. 

34-B . Deli;lery of pos?cssio?z of recolds mln' properlies af n registered 

society.-(1) Where the committee of a registered society is supersccled and 
a special oficcr is appointed under section 34-A ancl such special officcri is 
rerristed in, or  preventccl from, obtaining possession of the boolcs, accounts, 
documents, securities, cash and other properties, whether moval~le or 
immovable, of the socjety (hereafter in this section referrr 1 to as the rec01Lds 
and pi30pci%ies of thc society) by  thc committee which has been superscdcd, 
or by any person who iu not entitled to be in possession of the records axid 
properties of the society, nrzy Metropolitan Magistrate or  any Distzlict I f u s i f -  
cum-Judicial Magistrate, cxcr?i%ing tho powers of a Judicial Magist~ate of the 
first class in whose jurisdictiori the office of the eocicty or the records and 
properties of that society is, or are, situate ddall, on application by the special 
officer and on the production of the order1 made ulldcv section 34-A and of a 
certificate by the Registrar in thc, prescribed form sctting fol-th that the 
records and properties mentioned therein belong to the fegistered society, 
direct d%fivery to the special officer, of the p<sscssion 01 the records and 
properties of the society. 

(2) No certificate shall be issued by the Registrar unclcr mb- 
section (1) without mdring guch inquiry as he deems necessary. 

(3) For  the purpose of thc proceedings under suh-scetio:l (li), thc 
certificate aforesaid shdl  be conclusive cvidence that the records and 
prbperties to  which i t  relates belong to the registered society. 

( 4 )  The Metropolitan Magistrate or 'ie District &fU1lsif-cum- 
Judicial Magistrate exercising thc powers of a Judicial Magistrate of the f i rc t  
class rcferrcd to in sub-section (1) may, pending disposal of an applicatior, 
for directing clelivcr~, to the special officer, of the possession of the records 
and ~ r a ~ e r t i c s  of the society mentioned in the by the &fZistrar, 
appoint a 'Receiver to take possession of such rccoi.dg and propeptics or such 
portion thereof as map be necessary. The remuneration, if any, paid to the 
m ~ e r  and other e-XP n s -  by him a be pyhb from the 
of the re,@sterM society. 4 



I 

5. In section 52 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2 ) ,  fca the words 
" the Inspector-General of Registrati~n'~, the words " the Inspector-Genexhl 
of Registration or any other oflticer of the Registration depadtmerlt not below 
tho rank of Deputy InspectorLGeneral of Registration, as m;ty be authorised 
by the Govcrnmcn.t. in this behalf " shall be mbstituted. 

6. In Ihe Schcilule to the principal Act,- 

(a) in item 1, for the words " Fifty Rupees", the words " One hunclred 
Rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(b) in item 2, for the words " Two Rupees ", the worcls " lpivc Rupces" 
shall be qubstituted; 

(c) in item 3, for the wordq " Four Rupces ", the ~vor(ls " Tcn Rupens" 
shall be subqtituted ; 

(d) in item 4, for the word$ " BOUI! Rupees", the words " !Pen Rupees " 
  hall be substituted ; 

(e) in item 5, for the words " Seventy-five paise ", the words " Two 
Rupees " &all be substituted ; 

Rupees " &all be substituted. 

(By order of tlie Cove~nor) 

M .  M U n  RAMAN, 

Secretary to Government, Law Departmerrt. 

I 

Amendment ot 
section 36. 

Amendment of 
swt4oIl 44. 

Amendment of 
section 52. 

Amendment of 
Schedule. 



150 
- ----- - 

The following Act ctt the Trmil NzGu Legislative Ascin Fly receivcd 1 he 
assent of the Governol on tke 16;h Ju i~e  1499 a t d  is hereby published for general 
information :- 

ACT No. 21 CF 1999. 

An Act further to c.mcnd the Tamil Nadu Sociefits Rcyist~sticn 
Act, 1975. 

BE it enzcted by the Legislat i\ e Assenibly of 1ke Stct c el 7: n-rl NCC'I.L in thc 
Fiftieth Year of thc Rcpublic of India as fo1lov.s :-- 

)art title I .  ( I )  This Act may be crllcc? thc Tzmil K L ~ I ;  Socie!ics Registrrtion 
d commence. (Amendmcnt) Act, 1999. 
:nt. - 

(2) I t  shall come into force on such date zs the State Governn~cnt 
may, by notificat~on, ap~oint ,  

nendment 2. In  section9 of the 7 an!il Xadu Societies Registrstion Act, 1975, in 
section 9 sub. section (2) ,  in iten1 (c), tor the expression "Union" or "St~te", the expre5s:on Act 27 of 1575 

"Union" cr "State" or "Colnmission" or " F o r ~ m "  or "Council" shall be 
substituted. 

(BJ order of the G o ~ c ~ x o r )  

K. PARTE-IASARATHY, 
Secretary to Gover~~ment 

Law Departn-ent I. 

I .. I _ 
- - - _  _ 
2 

-- - -  - _ - - . - 

m - 



.. - - 

- - -  .--.- - -- - - -+ . _ _ ----- 

The following Act of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly received the assent of 
the Governor on the 11 th December 1999 and is hereby published for general 
information :- 

ACT No. 43 OF 1999. 

An Act further to amend the Tamil Nadu Societits Registration Act, 1975. 

Be ~t enacted by tbe Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in the 
Fiftieth Year of the Republic of India as follows :- 

I .  (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration (Second Short; title and 
Amendment) Act, 1999. Comman~~rnenO 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by 
notific~ tion, appoint. 

2. In  section 15 of the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975 (hereinafter Amendment of 
referred to as the principal Act), after sub-section (51, the following sub-section secdon 15. 
shall be added, namely :- 

"(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (5), any person 
who has completed six years continuously as a member of the committee shall be 
eligible, after one term has elapsed from the date of his ceasing to be such membw, 
for appointment to the committee.". 

3. Fcr the remaval of doubts, it is hereby declared that every member of the- Ranoval of 
committee appointed before the date of tho cvmmencement of this Act, shall continue daub. 
to be such member for the period for which he would have contin~ved as such 
member but for the amendment made to the principal Act by section 2 of tbis Act. 

(By order of the Governor) 

- 

K.. PARTHASARATHY, 
Secretary to Governmentt 

Law Department. 

- 
-1) 

BY THE D-OR OF STATIONERY AND P-&, CHENNAE 
ON THF, GOVERNMENT OF T A m  NAJ3.U. 



TAMIL NADU GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTF LAORDINARY 6 1 

The following Act of the Tam11 Nadu Legislative Assembly received the assent of the 
Governor on the 31st May 2000 and is hereby published for general information:- 

ACT No. 19 OF 2000. 

An Act jitrther to amend the Tc~mil Nflciu Societr~.s Registration Act, 197.5. 

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in the Fifty-first Year 
of the Republic of India as f-~llows:- 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration ( 
A r +  ?AAA 

[Amendment) Short title 
A L L ,  LVVV.  and 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 
commence- 
ment. 

Tmil Nadu 2. In section 15 of the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975, sub-section (6) shall m m e n t  
Aa 27 of be omitted. 

1971. 
of seaion 1s. 

(By order of the Governor) 

K. PARTHASARATHY, 
Secretary to Government, 
. Law Department. 



- -- --- 

OVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY 49 

'The following Act of the Tamil Nadu legislative Assembly received the assent of the 
Governor on the 26th May 2002 and is hereby published for general information:- 

..2 

ACT No. 15 OF 2002. 

An Act further to amend the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975. 

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in the Fifty-third 
Year of the Republic of India as follows:-- 

!! tf 1 .  (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration (Amendment) Short title and 

Act, 2002. commence- 
ment. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by 
i notification, appoint. 

;id Nadu Act 2. In the Schedule to the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration r t . :  1975,- Amendment of 
h of 1975 Schedule. 

(a) in item 1, for the words "One h~~ndred  Rupees", the words "Five hundred 
k Rupees" shall be substituted; 
I 

(b) in item 2, for the words "Five Rupees", the words "Ten Rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

I (c) in item 3, for the words "Ten Rupees", the words "Twenty-five Rupees" shall 
be substituted; 

1" (d) in item 4, for the words "Ten Rupees", the words "Twenty-five Rupees" shall 
be substituted; 

(e) in item 5, for the words "Two Rupees", the words "Five Rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

I 

(f) in item 6, for the words "Five Rupees", the words "Ten Rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(g) in item 7, for the words "Fifty Rupees", the words "One Hundred Rupees" 
shall be substituted. 

(By order of the Gover~lor) ' 

A. KRISHNANKUTTY NAIK, 
Secretury lo (;overrtnrenl, 

Luto Deparlt?ie~t. 


